
Requisition:
Requestor:

Date:
Bid No.

Bid Subject
Bid Open Date
Bid Open Time Little Rock, AR 72205

Bid Open By
FOB Point: Minority?

Award?
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

2
  

Lanyard 50 100 300 500 1000
no  bid 1.10$           0.92$              0.82$             0.74$                  

45.00$         45.00$            45.00$           45.00$                
155.00$       321.00$         455.00$        785.00$             

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
4 Rally Pom-pom 50 100 300 500 1000

no bid 1.06$           0.98$              0.98$             0.98$                  
25.00$         47.00$            47.00$           94.00$                

30.00$         30.00$            30.00$           30.00$                

161.00$       371.00$         567.00$        1,104.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

7
Wall Pennants 

Pennant 9" x 24" 50 300 500 1000 2000
no bid 2.26$           1.99$              1.64               1.54$                  

45.00$         45.00$            45.00$           45.00$                

723.00$       1,040.00$      1,685.00$     3,125.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

8

Antibacterial 
hand sanitizer 

sprayer 50 200 400 500 1000

no bid 0.92$           0.92$              0.89$             0.89$                  

21.00$         27.00$            30.00$           59.00$                

45.00$         45.00$            45.00$           45.00$                
no bid 250.00$       440.00$         520.00$        994.00$             

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
10 50 300 500 1000 2000

no bid 1.09$           0.91$              0.89               0.83$                  

43.00$         43.00$            43.00             43.00$                
no bid 370.00$       498.00$         933.00$        1,703.00$          

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
12 1 2 3 4 5

289.00$              289.00$       289.00$         289.00           289.00$              

University of Arkansas

CAMPUS BID

UAPB Warehouse 1200 N. Uni. 

CHOICE PROMOTIONS
Bid Tabulation Sheet

(4) Bidder Name: Choice Promotional 
Contact: Loretta Lever

Tuesday, August 22, 2023 Phone: (501) 666-9499
UAPB A137 Email: Choicepromotions1@gmail.com
Promotional Items Fax:
Friday, September 15, 2023 Address: 415 N. McKinley St. Suite 280T
10:00 A.M. CST

Yes
m/Annex Building Pine Bluff, Arkansas 7

Pen & Sanitizer 
Spray

Tent

mailto:Choicepromotions1@gmail.com
mailto:Choicepromotions1@gmail.com


289.00$              578.00$       867.00$         1,156.00$     1,445.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

16

Selfie/Online 
Meeting 

Adjustable Ring 
Light 50 100 200 300 500

4.56$                   4.00$           3.56$              3.56$             3.49$                  

45.00$                45.00$         45.00$            45.00$           45.00$                

273.00$              445.00$       757.00$         1,113.00$     1,790.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

19
Two pocket 

folders 25 50 100 150 200

no bid no bid 4.43$              4.05$             3.63$                  

no bid no bid 443.00$         607.50$        726.00$             
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

21 300 500 1000 2500 5000
1.39$                   1.01$           0.82$              0.72$             0.52$                  

43.00$                43.00$         43.00$            43.00$           43.00$                
460.00$              548.00$       863.00$         1,843.00$     2,643.00$          

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

23

White Vinyl 
Decal with 

Custom Die Cut 
Shape 250 500 1000 1500 2000

1.07$                   0.93$           0.81$              0.74$             0.69$                  

39.00$                39.00$         49.00$            49.00$           49.00$                

267.50$              465.00$       810.00$         1,110.00$     1,380.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

25
1” Lanyard with 

Lobster Clip 100 250 500 1000 2500 5000
0.98$                   0.98$           0.73$              0.73$             0.65$                  0.59$                       

Handheld 
retractable 



40.00$                40.00$         40.00$            40.00$           40.00$                40.00$                     

138.00$              285.00$       405.00$         770.00$        1,665.00$          2,990.00$               
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

22
Luggage tag 

(plastic) 50 250 1000 2500 5000
no bid 1.24$           0.95$              0.81$             0.58$                  

43.00$         106.00$         173.00$        338.00$              

48.00$         48.00$            48.00$           48.00$                

no bid 401.00$       1,104.00$      2,246.00$     3,286.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

3
22 oz Stadium 

cups 50 100 300 500 1000
no bid 0.71$           0.71$              0.71$             0.71$                  

24.00$         33.00$            36.00$           72.00$                

37.00$         37.00$            37.00$           37.00$                

no bid 132.00$       283.00$         428.00$        819.00$             
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